

Date: 31 July 2012  
 Bill No: 289909  
 Our Ref: 600154/David Neutze/Lisa Walsh

**SCHEDULE OF ATTENDANCES****GRACE HADEN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Details</b>	<b>Solicitor</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>\$ Amount</b>
25.06.12	Research procedural rules regarding whether or not substituted plaintiff may rely on original demand and discuss with Lisa.	NFL	1.7	212.50
25.06.12	Attendance on file regarding substituted plaintiff (Hoadley) proceedings	LGH	0.3	78.00
26.06.12	Research and report to Lisa regarding likelihood of bankruptcy application being successful.	NFL	1.4	175.00
26.06.12	Attendance on preparing liquidation proceedings on behalf of substituted plaintiff	LGH	1.0	260.00
26.06.12	Attendance on finalising the liquidation proceedings on behalf of the substituted plaintiff	LGH	0.5	130.00
26.06.12	Attendances checking draft statement of claim for substituted plaintiff to ensure consistency with cases	NFL	0.3	37.50
26.06.12	Attendance on preparing breakdown of calculations for letter to Peter McCutcheon	LGH	0.5	130.00
26.06.12	Reviewing statement of claim and internal conference with Lisa	BXA	0.2	46.00
27.06.12	Telephone from Wyn regarding substituted plaintiff proceedings	LGH	0.2	52.00
27.06.12	Attendance on preparing demand for payment of all further debts	LGH	1.0	260.00
27.06.12	Attendance on email to you attaching letter of demand for your approval	LGH	0.2	52.00
27.06.12	Reviewing letter to Peter McCutcheon and emails to/from Lisa, Grace Haden and Peter McCutcheon	BXA	0.3	69.00
28.06.12	Research cases regarding lodging charging order against funds held in trust account of debtor.	NFL	0.4	50.00
28.06.12	Attendance on various emails with you regarding demand on Haden/Verisure; emails to and from Peter McCutcheon	LGH	1.0	260.00
28.06.12	Attendance on finalising the demand; reviewing email from Grace Haden; responding to the same; attendance on Wyn regarding her affidavit; drafting letter to the Court regarding the substituted plaintiff proceedings	LGH	2.0	520.00
29.06.12	Attendance on reviewing email from Grace Haden; telephone to the High Court regarding security for costs; attendance on drafting settlement letter to Grace Haden; forwarding copy to your for your information	LGH	2.0	520.00
29.06.12	Finalise letter to Grace Haden regarding settlement and memo to court on the bankruptcy application.	DJN	0.4	200.00
29.06.12	Conferences (over several days) with Lisa and Ben regarding strategy on settlement, bankruptcy and liquidation.	DJN	1.2	600.00
29.06.12	Attendance on sorting memo and preparing affidavit in support	LGH	2.0	520.00
29.06.12	Internal conferences with Lisa; review emails from and to Grace Haden; draft memorandum to the High Court	BXA	1.2	276.00
02.07.12	Reviewing letter and information capsule received from Grace Haden	BXA	0.5	115.00
02.07.12	Reviewing affidavit	BXA	0.2	46.00
02.07.12	Attendance on finalising affidavit in support of judgment creditor's memorandum	LGH	0.5	130.00
02.07.12	Reviewing letter and information capsule from Grace Haden; telephone discussion with you regarding the same	LGH	0.5	130.00

**SCHEDULE OF ATTENDANCES (continued)****GRACE HADEN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Details</b>	<b>Solicitor</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>\$ Amount</b>
03.07.12	Attendance on file for hearing on 3 July 2012	LGH	0.5	130.00
03.07.12	Attendance on sorting District Court proceedings	LGH	0.3	78.00
03.07.12	Preparation and attendance at High Court	BXA	3.0	690.00
03.07.12	E-mail to you and telephone call with you	BXA	0.5	115.00
03.07.12	Attendances with Ben regarding bankruptcy and finalise report.	DJN	0.4	200.00
04.07.12	Attendance on preparing further order for costs; letter to the Court	LGH	1.0	260.00
04.07.12	Attendance on CT search	LGH	0.2	52.00
04.07.12	Attendance on preparing further demand letter against VIL	LGH	1.0	260.00
05.07.12	E-mail to Peter McCutcheon about money being held on trust	BXA	0.1	23.00
05.07.12	Attendance on LTO and Company search regarding property at Wapiti Ave; email to you to update on the Liquidation and District Court proceedings	LGH	0.5	130.00
05.07.12	Attendance on advertisement for putting company into liquidation	LGH	0.5	130.00
06.07.12	E-mail from Grace Haden	BXA	0.1	23.00
06.07.12	Reviewing email from Grace Haden and conference with Ben regarding strike out strategy.	DJN	0.3	150.00
06.07.12	Attendance on email to the Herald and the Gazette attaching advertisement putting company into liquidation	LGH	0.4	104.00
09.07.12	Attendance on affidavit of service; letter to the High Court enclosing the same	LGH	0.4	104.00
09.07.12	Attendance on email from the Herald attaching proof; reviewing the same; email to the Herald	LGH	0.3	78.00
09.07.12	E-mail to the Gazette following up on proof	LGH	0.1	26.00
09.07.12	Attendance on email from the Gazette attaching proof; reviewing proof and email to the Gazette to confirm the same	LGH	0.2	52.00
09.07.12	Attendance on demand on VIL; preparing appearance in support for you for hearing on 20 July 2012	LGH	1.5	390.00
10.07.12	Attendance on finalising demand and appearance in support	LGH	0.5	130.00
10.07.12	Reviewing minute of AJ Sargisson; preparing costs order	LGH	1.0	260.00
10.07.12	E-mail from High Court; review minute; email to Peter McCutcheon	BXA	0.2	46.00
11.07.12	Attendance on finalising order for costs; letter to the Court	LGH	0.5	130.00
12.07.12	Attendance on Herald advertisement	LGH	0.1	26.00
13.07.12	Attendance on preparing statement of advertising	LGH	0.3	78.00
16.07.12	Attendance on letter to the Court enclosing statement of advertising	LGH	0.2	52.00
16.07.12	Attendance on appearance in support	LGH	0.5	130.00
16.07.12	Attendance on updating amounts owed to you; updating appearance in support; filing the same with the High Court	LGH	1.0	260.00
18.07.12	Research likelihood of successful strike out application to the District Court, and merit of other claims in proceedings filed by Grace Haden for your information capsule.	NFL	1.8	225.00
20.07.12	Preparation and attendance at High Court	BXA	2.3	529.00
20.07.12	E-mail to you	BXA	0.1	23.00
20.07.12	Telephone call from you	BXA	0.2	46.00
24.07.12	Attendance on preparing order for sealing (liquidation)	LGH	0.5	130.00
24.07.12	Attendance on Official Assignee	LGH	0.2	52.00

**SCHEDULE OF ATTENDANCES (continued)****GRACE HADEN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Details</b>	<b>Solicitor</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>\$ Amount</b>
25.07.12	Attendances on going through Grace Haden's information capsule/notice of claim for District Court matter to see whether any additional causes of action and finalise research regarding possibility of strike out and deceit.	NFL	2.2	275.00
25.07.12	Attendance on Translegal; attendance on High Court; attendance on memorandum	LGH	1.0	260.00
25.07.12	Attendance on filing memorandum; email to and from Grace Haden; telephone discussion with you	LGH	0.5	130.00
25.07.12	Finalise memo to court, emails to Grace Haden to resolve issues relating to Translegal and payment by Verisure.	DJN	0.4	200.00
26.07.12	Attendance on further memorandum; statement of process server; email to Grace Haden; email to the Court	LGH	2.0	520.00
26.07.12	Attendance on statement on behalf of process server; further memorandum on behalf of substituted plaintiff; attendance on payment; email correspondence with the High Court; email to Grace Haden	LGH	2.2	572.00
27.07.12	Preparation and attendance at High Court	BXA	2.2	506.00
30.07.12	Attendance on email to you regarding hearing on Friday 27 July 2012	LGH	0.3	78.00
30.07.12	Telephone from Translegal Services regarding Haden	LGH	0.2	52.00
31.07.12	Attendance on letter to you	LGH	0.5	130.00
31.07.12	Attendance on preparing statutory demand; calculating amounts up to 31 July 2012	LGH	1.0	260.00
Total time and work performed			52.7	\$12,964.00
GST on fee				\$1,944.60
<b>Total Fee (inclusive of GST)</b>			<b>NZ \$</b>	<b><u>14,908.60</u></b>

**Time Charged**

<b>Solicitor</b>	<b>Position</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>\$ Amount</b>
Benjamin Atkins	Solicitor	11.1	\$230.00	2,553.00
David Neutze	Partner	2.7	\$500.00	1,350.00
Lisa Walsh	Legal Executive - As	31.1	\$260.00	8,086.00
Natalie Lord	Solicitor	7.8	\$125.00	975.00
Total time and work performed		52.7		\$12,964.00
GST on fee				1,944.60
Disbursements and office charges (inclusive of GST)				1,623.57
<b>Total for this account (inclusive of GST)</b>			<b>NZ \$</b>	<b><u>\$16,532.17</u></b>